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LEGISLATIVE RECORD-SENATE JANUARY 25 77 

SENATE 

January 25, 1933 
Senate called to order by the 

President 
Prayer by the Rev. L. D. Porter of 

Gardiner. 
Journal of Tuesday, January 24th, 

read and approved. 

Papers from the House disposed 
of in concurrence. 

From the House: 
Resolve providing for the com­

pletion of Route No. 139. (H. P. 140) 
In the House, referred to the 

Committee on Ways and Bridges. 
In the Senate, on motion by Mr. 

Littlefield of York, tabled pending 
reference in concurrence. 

The following bill was received 
and on recommendation by the com­
mittee on reference of bills was 
referred to the following commit­
tee: 

Agriculture 
Mr. Story of Aroostook: An Act 

to assure proper branding of pota­
toes. (S. P. 77). 

(500 copies ordered printed,) 
Sent down for concurrence. 

Orders of the Day 
The PRESIDENT: The Senate 

will recess until the sound of the 
gavel. 

After Recess 
The Senate was called to order 

by the President. 

(Emergency Measure) 
Out of order and under suspen­

sion of the rules. "An Act to 
empower the county commissioners 
of Hancock County to construct a 
high~~y and raise money for the 
same. (S. P. 35, L. D. 9). 

Which act being an emergency 

measure, and having received the 
affirmative vote of 29 members of 
the Senate, was passed to be enact­
ed, and having been signed by the 
President was by the Secretary pre­
sented to the Governor for his ap­
proval. 

(Emergeney Measure) 
Out of order and under suspen­

sion of the rules. "An Act to amend 
Section 110 of Chapter 5 of the 
Revised Statutes of Maine for 1930." 
(S. P. 36. L. D. 11). 

Which act being an emergency 
measure, and having received the 
affirmative vote of 29 members of 
the Senate, was passed to be enact­
ed, and having been signed by the 
President was by the Secretary pre­
sented to the Governor for 'lis ap­
proval. 

On motion by Mr. Littlefield of 
York, the Senate voted to take from 
the table, Resolve providing for the 
completion of Route No. 139. (H. P. 
140), tabled by that Senator earlier 
in today's session pending reference 
in concurrence; and on further 
motion by the same Senator the 
resolve was referred to the Com­
mittee on Ways and Bridges in con­
currence. 

On motion by Mr. Robie of Cum­
berland, the Senate voted to take 
from the table, Order relative to 
providing each officer and member 
with a copy of the Revised Statutes, 
tabled by that Senator on January 
19th pending consideration; and on 
further motion by the same Senator 
the order was restored to the files 
of the Senate. 

The PRESIDENT: Is there any 
further business to come before the 
Senate? 

On motion by Mr. Pillsbury of 
Kennebec, 

Adjourned, until tomorrow morn­
ing at ten o'clock. 


