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2218 
CHAP. 679 

Sec. 10. 9 MRSA § 5008, sub-§ 3 is enacted to read: 

PUBLIC LAWS, 1979 

3. Annual reports. A professional fund-raising counsel, professional solicitor 
or commercial co-venturer shall file an annual report which states the names and 
addresses of all charitable organizations for whom any solicitation was 
conducted, the total amount raised and the amount paid to the charitable 
organization on a form with such verification as the Secretary of State shall 
prescribe by regulation. 

Sec. 11. 9 MRSA § 5012, as enacted by PL 1977, c. 488, ~ 1, is amended to read: 

§ 5012. Charitable solicitation disclosure 

It shall be a violation of this chapter for a professional fund-raising counsel, 
professional solicitor, commercial co-venturer or any other person to solicit 
contributions from a prospective donor in this State without fully disclosing to the 
prospective donor at the time of solicitation the estimated percentage of each 
dollar contributed which will be expended for eharitable purposes program 
services, fund raising and management when less than 70% of the amount donated 
contributed will be se expended for program services. In addition, any person 
required to register under section 5008, or any of his agents, who solicits 
contributions shall disclose to the prospective donor at the time of the solicitation 
the percentage of the gross contribution which will constitute his compensation 
and all fund-raising expenses connected with that particular contract. 

Effective July 3, 1980 

CHAPTER 679 
H. P. 1829 - L. D. 1933 

AN ACT to Promote Hunting, Fishing and Camping in Maine. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Sec. 1. 12 MRSA § 7034, sub-§ 8 is enacted to read: 

8. Promotion of hunting, fishing and camping, The commissioner may 
implement a program designed to promote fisheries and wildlife resources and 
attract hunters and fishermen to the State. This program may include 
coordination of activities between the public and private sectors and utilization of 
promotional missions, exhibits, brochures, technical assistance and expertise as 
necessary to develop and promote hunting, fishing and camping activities within 
the State. The commissioner shall coordinate this program with the activities of 
the State Development Office and the Maine Publicity Bureau. 
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CHAP. 680 

Sec. 2. 12 MRSA § 7074, sub-§ 3, ,-rB, as enacted by PL 1979, c. 420, ~ 1, is 
amended to read: 

B. The protection, propagation, preservation, promotion and investigation of 
fish and wildlife; 

Effective July 3, 1980 

CHAPTER 680 
S. fl. 680 - L. D. 1798 

AN ACT to Amend the Maine Health Facilities Authority Act to Include Certain 
Educational Institutions. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows:. 

Sec. 1. 22 MRSA § 2051, as enacted by PL 1971, c. 303, ~ 1, is amended to read: 

§ 2051. Title 

This chapter shall be known as, and may be cited as, the "Maine Health and 
Higher Educational Facilities Authority Act." 

Sec. 2. 22 MRSA § 2052, as amended by PL 1973, c. 713, ~ 1, is further 
amended to read: 

§ 2052. Declaration of necessity 

It is declared that for the benefit of the people of the State, the increase of their 
commerce, welfare and prosperity and the improvement of their health and living 
conditions, it is essential that hospitals and nursing homes within the State be 
provided with appropriate additional means to expand, enlarge and establish 
health care, hospital, nursing home and other related facilities; that this and 
future generations of students be given the fullest opportunity to learn and to 
develop their intellectual capacities; and that it is the purpose of this chapter to 
provide a measure of assistance and an alternative method to enable hospitals 
aOO, nursing homes and institutions for higher education in the State to provide the 
facilities and structures which are sorely needed to accomplish the purposes of 
this chapter, all to the public benefit and good, and the exercise of the powers, to 
the extent and manner provided in this chapter, is declared the exercise of an 
essential governmental function. 

Sec. 3. 22 MRSA § 2053, sub-§§ 1 and 2, as enacted by PL 1971, c. 303, ~ 1, are 
amended to read: 


