
 
MAINE STATE LEGISLATURE 

 
 
 

The following document is provided by the 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DIGITAL LIBRARY 

at the Maine State Law and Legislative Reference Library 
http://legislature.maine.gov/lawlib 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Reproduced from scanned originals with text recognition applied 
(searchable text may contain some errors and/or omissions) 

 
 



LAWS 
OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE 
AS PASSED BY THE 

One Hundred and Sixth Legislature 

1ST SPECIAL SESSION 

JANUARY 2, 1974 TO MARCH 29, 1974 

AND BY THE 

One Hundred and Seventh Legislature 

REGULAR SESSION 

JANUARY 1, 1975 TO JULY 2,1975 

PUBLISHED BY THE DIRECTOR OF LEGISLATIVE RESEARCH IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH THE REVISED STATUT-ES OF 1964, TITLE 3, 
SECTION 164, SUBSECTION 6. 

THE KNOWLTON AND McLEARY COMPANY 

F ARMINGTON, MAINE 

1975 



PUBLIC LAWS 

OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE 
AS PASSED BY THE 

One Hundred and Seventh Legislature 

1975 



PUBLIC LAWS, 1975 
82.3 

CHAP. 235 

sion. Any revisions or amendments to the adopted plan and regulation that 
are less protective than those in the adopted plan shall be submitted to the 
Land Use Regulation Commission for approval. 

Sec. 2. 12 MRSA § 68S-A, sub-§ 4, last paragraph, as enacted by PL 197J. 
c. 457, § 5, is repealed and the following enacted in place thereof: 

Any municipality organized after September 23, 1971, may submit to the 
commission and receive the approval of the commission of the following: 

A. A comprehensive land use plan for such proposed city or town; 

B. Standards for determining land use district boundaries and uses per­
mitted within such districts in such proposed city or town; 

C. A land use district boundary map for such proposed city or town; 

D. Such other proposed regulations or standards as the comn1ission deems 
to be necessary to achieve the purpose, intent and provisions of this chap­
ter; .and 

E. Upon request of the municipality, the commission shall prepare such 
plans, maps, regulations and standards as it may deem necessary to meet 
minimum planning and zoning standards for its approval thereof. 

Upon obtaining the foregoing approval, the city or town shall thereafter 
adopt, administer and enforce such approved plans, maps, regulations and 
standards. 

Effective October 1, 1975 

CHAPTER 235 

AN ACT Relating to Cruelty to Animals. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

17 MRSA § 1058 is amended to read: 

§ 1058. Coloring or dyeing live animals or birds 

It shall be unlawful to sell, offer for sale, give away or display within this 
State any live animals, reptiles or live birds of any kind which have been 
dyed or otherwise artificially colored or to sell in lots less than 6, offer for 
sale, give away, raffle or display any live fowl or turtle under 2 months of 
age for use as toys or retail premiums or to sell, offer for sale, give away, 
raffle or display any live animal, fowl or reptile as a fund-raising device. 
Whoever violates this section shall be punished by a fine of not more than 
$50 . 

Nothing in this section shall be construed to apply to any animal to be 
used or raised for agricultural purposes by persons with proper facilities 
otherwise authorized by law. 

Effective October 1, 1975 




