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SUPERINTENDING SCHOOL COMMITTEE OF FALMOUTH 777 

PRIVATE AND SPECIAL, 1959 CHAP. 69 

Chapter 68 

AN ACT Relating to Location of Maine Maritime Academy. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

P. & S. L., 1941, c. 37, § I, amended. The 1st paragraph o( section I of 
chapter 37 of the private and special laws of I94I, as amended by section I of 
chapter I02 of the private and special laws of I94I, is further amended to read 
as follows: 

'There is hereby created "Maine Maritime Academy," which shall be a body 
corporate and politic, having the same rights, privileges and powers as have 
corporations organized under the general law, with the right to adopt a common 
seal and to establish by-laws and regulations for the management of its affairs 
not repugnant to its charter and the laws of the State of Maine, and with the 
principal location of its school in Castine, Hancock County, ~ State of Maine. 
The principal location shall not be changed without an act of the Legislature.' 

Effective September 12, 1959 

Chapter 69 

AN ACT Relating to Superintending School Committee of Town of Falmouth. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Superintending school committee. The Town of Falmouth may increase the 
membership of the superintending school committee to 5 members. 

The Town of Falmouth may choose by ballot at its annual town meeting 3 
additional superintending school committee members to serve with the 2 mem­
bers already in office, and shall fill vacancies arising therein at each subsequent 
annual town meeting. 

The 3 members thus chosen shall designate by lot one member to serve 2 

years and the other 2 members to serve 3 years; and they shall certify such 
designation to the town clerk to be by him recorded; and thereafter the mem­
bers shall be chosen by ballot at the annual meeting of the Town of Falmouth to 
hold office for 3 years. Said committee may fill vacancies occurring between 
annual meetings, and the term of office of any member of the committee so 
chosen shall expire at the next annual meeting. 

A vote of a majority of the full membership of the committee shall be required 
for the purpose of conducting business and exercising the powers of the com­
mittee and for all other purposes. 

No member of the superintending school committee shall be employed as a 
teacher in any public school or contract high school or academy located within 
this supervisory union. In case any member of the superintending school corn:" 
mittee shall remove from the town or be absent for more than 90 days, a vacancy 
shall be declared to exist and the remaining members shall, within 30 days there­
after, choose another member as hereinbefore provided. Whenever the remain-' 
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