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MONIES FOR CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS 

PRIVATE AND SPECIAL, 1957 

967 

CHAP. 195 

'(3) To sell, lease or otherwise make available land in such areas for resi­
dential, recreational, commercial, industrial or other use or for public use, ~ 
~ i€H' including public housing, or to retain such land for public use, ~ 
i€H' including public housing, in accordance with a redevelopment plan. Public 
housing shall mean housing erected by a local housing authority in accordance 
with chapter 441 of the public laws of 1949.' 

Effective August 28, 1957 

Chapter 194 

AN ACT to Increase the Salary of Judge of Western Somerset Municipal Court. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

P. & S. L., 1909, c. 331, § 8, amended. The 1st sentence of section 8 of chapter 
331 of the private and special laws of 1909, as amended by chapter 130 of the 
private and special laws of 1949 and by section 1 of chapter 51 of the private and 
special laws 6f 1953, is hereby further amended to read as follows: 

'As compensation for his services in that capacity the judge of said court shall 
receive an annual salary of ~,eee $3,500, payable in quarterly installments from 
the treasury of the county of Somerset, on the 1st days of January, April, July 
and October, and in addition shall receive his necessary traveling expenses, in­
cluding mileage allowance, hotel expenses, meals, etc., when holding court in 
another town than that in which he resides, and he shall receive an additional 
sum of $1,500 per year for clerk hire and such additional amount as may be au­
thorized by the county commissioners.' 

Effective August 28, 1957 

Chapter 195 

AN ACT to Appropriate Monies for Capital Improvements and Construction of 
State Government for the Fiscal Years Ending June 30, 1958, and June 30, 
1959· 

Emergency preamble. Whereas, acts of the Legislature do not become effec­
tive until 90 days after adjournment; and 

Whereas, facilities of the various departments in rendering necessary services 
established by law are badly in need of repair, construction and reconstruction; 
and 

Whereas, in order to accomplish the greatest possible improvement in these 
facilities for the total needs of the people of the State of Maine, it is vitally 
necessary that these repairs, constructions and reconstructions be commenced as 
soon as possible this year; and 

Whereas, in the judgment of the Legislature, these facts create an emergency 
within the meaning of the Constitution of Maine, and require the following legis-
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