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UPTON TO ACQumE OAPITAL STOCK OF ELECTRIC OOMPANY 449 

CHAP. 40 

ate article being inserted in the call for such meeting. If a majority of 
the qualified voters of the Phillips Village Corporation 'voting at such 
meeting vote in favor of the acceptance of this act, it shall become operative 
and fully effective. A certificate of such vote shall be filed with the secre­
tary of state by the clerk of the corporation. 

Approved :lIIarch 24, 1941 

Chapter 39 

AN ACT Changing the Name of Bangor Gas Light Company to Bangor 
Gas Company. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Change of name. Bangor Gas Light Company, a corporation created by 
chapter 4IO of the private and special laws of 1850, hereby is authorized to 
change its name to Bangor Gas Company, subject to the provisions of sec­
tion 57 of chapter 56 of the revised statutes, as amended. If and when the 
name of Bangor Gas Light Company is changed to Bangor Gas Company, 
the corporation, under the name of Bangor Gas Company, shall have all the 
rights, powers, privileges and franchises at any time granted to and enjoyed 
by Bangor Gas Light Company, subject, however, to the provisions of all 
applicable general laws, and shall be subject to all the duties, obligations 
and liabilities of said Bangor Gas Light Company. 

Approved lIlarch 24, 1941 

Chapter 40 

AN ACT to Enable the Town of Upton to Acquire the Capital Stock of 
Company Producing and Distributing Electricity Within Its Territorial 
Limits. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Acquisition of stock of power company, authorized. The town of Upton 
is hereby authorized to acquire and own all, but not less than all, of the 
outstanding capital stock of Upton Light, Heat & Power Company, a cor­
poration operating in said town as a public utility producing and distribut­
ing electricity, and to pay therefor amounts not in excess of the amounts 
received by said corporation in consideration for the issuance thereof plus 
interest from the date of issuance thereof to the date of acquisition thereof 
by said town of Upton, said amounts and interest so to be paid in no event 
to exceed in the aggregate the sum of $300. While said stock is owned by 
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