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660 RESOLVE IN FAVOR OF CLAYTON FRENCH. 

CHAP. 106 

(3) That any boat or boats in tow from another boat or hitched to 
another boat, for the purposes of these regulations shall be considered as 
I unit and the limitations provided herein shall apply to all the occupants 
of such boats thus hi.tched together as if they occupied but I boat. 

Approved April 4, 1935. 

Chapter 104. 

RESOL VE, Regulating Fishing in Tributaries to Pleasant, Horseshoe and 
Mud Ponds in Kennebec and Sagadahoc Counties. 

Fishing in tributaries to Pleasant pond, regulated. Resolved: That the 
commissioner of inland fisheries and game be, and hereby is, directed to 
issue a rule and regulation opening to fishing the tributaries to Pleasant. 
Horseshoe and Mud ponds and Cobbosseecontee stream in the counties 
of Kennebec and Sagadahoc. 

Approyed April 4, 1935. 

Chapter 105. 

RESOLVE, in Favor of Ethel M. Parker, of Portland. 

Ethel M. Parker, appropriation for. Resolved: That there be, and 
hereby is, appropriated, the sum of $2,500 to be paid to the department of 
health and welfare to be used in the discretion of said department for the 
benefit of Ethel M. Parker, of Portland, widow of Herbert C. Parker, who 
was killed by an inmate of the state school for boys while endeavoring to 
capture said inmate as he attempted to make his escape from the institu­
tion. In the event of death of said Ethel M. Parker, any unexpended 
balance of said fund in excess of burial ~'Cpenses shall be paid to the 
treasurer of state, said sum to be paid from the general state funds. 

Approyed April 5, 1935. 

Chapter 106. 

RESOLVE, in Favor of Clayton French, of Carmel. 

Clayton French, compensated. Resolved: That there be, and hereby is, 
appropriated, the sum of $300 to be held in trust by the department of 
health and welfare, to be expended by it for the benefit of Clayton French, 
said sum being a settlement in full for injuries inflicted on him by Maurice 
Eastman, a state charge, said sum to be paid from the general state funds. 

Approyed April 5, 1935. 
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