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150 TRUST FUNDS OF CORPORATIONS. 

CHAP. 166 

ful cases of the minors employed under a work permit. A work per­
mit when duly issued shall e..'\:cuse such child from attendance at public 
schools; but no person shall issue such permit to any minor then in or 
about to enter his employment or the employment of the firm or corpo­
ration of which he is a member, stockholder, officer, or employee.' 

Approved April 2, 1931. 

Chapter 166. 

AN ACT Relating to the Transfer of Trust Funds of Corporations, 
Trustees, Unincorporated Bodies and Associations, and Extending the 
Provisions Thereof. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Jyfaine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 20, sec. 34; relating to trust funds may be transferred, amended. 
Section thirty-four of chapter twenty of the revised statutes is hereby 
amended by striking out the whole of said section and inserting in place 
thereof, the foll?wing: 

'Sec. 34. Transfer of certain trust funds; provisions for. Any corpo­
ration, trustees, unincorporated body or association, including a society, 
lodge or club by whom funds or property are now held or to who~ they 
have been or shall hereafter be entrusted by will, or by whom they have 
been or shalJ hereafter be acquired by purchase, gift or otherwise, for any 
religious, moral, educational, fraternal or benevolent purpose, may transfer, 
convey and deliver to any other corporate body or trustees existing for 
the same or similar purposes, such funds or property as is now or shall 
hereafter come into their or its possession or shall have been given to it 
or them to be administered in the manner and for the purposes provided 
by the donor, or as originally intended at the time of such purchase or 
acquisition. 

Provided, however, that no transfer of such funds or conveyance of any 
other kind of property shall be made without the approval of a justice of 
a superior court or the judge of probate for the county in which the donor 
resides or resided at the time of his decease, if the property was acquired 
by gift or under any trust agreement or testamentary provision.' 

_<\.pproved April 2, 1931. 
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