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"BLUE SKY L..<\' W." 277 

CHAP. 297 

Chapter 296. 
An Act Relating to Salaries of Public Officers, and the Compensation of Members 

of the Government. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., c. II7, sec. 3I; relating to the public utilities commission, amended. 
Section thirty-one of chapter one hundred and seventeen of the revised 
statutes, is hereby amended by striking out said section in its entirety and 
inserting in place thereof the following: 

'Sec. 3I. Salaries increased. The annual salary of each member of the 
public utilities commission shall be six thousand dollars provided however 
that prior to June thirtieth, nineteen hundred and thirty the chairman shall 
be paid at the rate of five thousand dollars per annum and each other mem­
ber at the rate of four thousand five hundred dollars per annum. The 
salary of subordinate officials and employees of said commission shall be 
left to the discretion of the public utilities commission, subject to approval 
of the governor and council; the commissioners and all employees shall 
receive actual expenses when traveling on official business.' 

Approved April 12, 1929. 

Chapter 297. 
An Act to Amend the Act Defining the Term "Securities" Under the "Blue Sky Law." 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Sec. I. P. L., 1923, c. 144, sec. 124; relating to application for registra­
tion, amended. Section one hundred and twenty-four of chapter one hun­
dred and forty-four of the public laws of nineteen hundred and twenty­
three is hereby amended by adding to said section the following: 

~pplication and fee. 'Public utilities whose securities have been author­
ized by the Maine public utilities commission shall be registered as dealers 
in such securities upon written application and payment of the fee pre­
scribed in section one hundred and thirty-five of chapter one hundred and 
forty-four of the public laws of nineteen hundred and twenty-three without 
filing any data or information other than an affidavit showing the approval 
of such securities by the Maine public utilities commission. Said regis­
tration shall cover any further issue of securities of said public utilities 
authorized by the Maine public utilities commission during the period that 
said registration or renewal thereof is in force.' 

Sec. 2. P. L., 1923, c. I 44, sec. I26; relating to definition of terms 
"dealer" and "securities," amended. Amend second paragraph of section 
one hundred and twenty-six of chapter' one hundred and forty-four of the 
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