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22 PENOBSCOT INDL>\..1'/S. 

CHAP. 28 

The term "net railway operating income" means the railway operating 
revenues less the railway operating expenses, tax accruals and uncollect­
ible railway revenues, including in the computation thereof debits and 
credits arising from equipment rents and joint facility rents. The public 
utilities commission, after notice and hearing, may determine the accuracy 
of any returns required of any railroad, and if found inaccurate, may order 
proper corrections to be made therein.' . 

(Passed oVer- Governor's veto, :rrlarch 25, 1927.) 

Chapter 28. 

_4.n Act Relating to the Pe~obscot Tribe of Indians. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of 1.11 aine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 14, sec. 24; relating to relief of members of Penobscot tribe of 
Indians found destitute beyond reservation, amended. Section twenty-four 
of chapter fourteen of the revised statutes is hereby amended by adding 
thereto the following: 'Any member of said tribe found destitute and in 
distress beyond the tribal reservation may be removed by the agent from 
any place in which he may be residing, or be found, to said tribal reserva­
tion, whenever, in the judgment of the ·agent, such removal should be 
made,' so that said section, as amended, shall read as follows: 

'Sec. 24. May be removed to the reservation if agent so determines. 
When any member of said tribe is found destitute and in distress beyond 
the tribal reservation and is relieved by the town in this state 'where he 
is so found, the overseers of the poor of said town may send to the agent 
a statement specifying the nature, dates and amounts of the supplies fur­
nished, which shall be transmitted to the governor and council with such 
additional statements of fact as said agent may think proper; and the 
state shall reimburse said town for the relief so furnished, to such extent 
as the governor and council adjudge to have been necessarily expended 
therefor. Any member of said tribe found destitute and in distress beyond 
the tribal reservation may be removed by the agent from any place in 
which he may be residing, or be found, to said tribal reservation, when­
ever, in the judgment of the agent, such removal should be made.' 

Approyed JliIarch 28, 1927. 
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