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CHAP. 6 

CAMDEN.AND ROCKLAND WATER CO. 

hundred and nine, and recorded in Cumberland county registry of deeds, 
book 851, page 229. . 

Deed of trust from trustees of Gorham academy in the county of ·Cum­
berland to state of Maine dated the twenty-sixth day of September one 
thousand nine hundred and twenty-four, and recorded in Cumberland 
county registry of deeds, book II83, page 352, conveying the same premises 
above described in trust for the joint use of the state of Maine and the 
town of Gorham for the erection of buildings for school purposes in con­
nection with the state Normal School located at said Gorham for educa­
tional purposes, and for such purposes as are set forth in said deed. 

Approved February 21, 1925. 

Chapter 6. 

An Act to Amend Section One of Chapter Nine of the Private and Special Laws of 
Eighteen Hundred and Eighty-seven Relating to the Camden and Rocl,land 
Water Company. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

P. & S. L., I887, c. 9, sec. I; relating to capital stock of Camden and 
Rockland Water Co., amended. Section one of chapter nine of the private 
and special laws of eighteen hundred and eighty-seven is hereby amended. 
to read as follows: 

'Sec. I •. Capital stock increased to $I,OOO,ooo; stock may be issued as 
common or preferred; subject to provisions of R. S., c. 55, sec. 37. The 
Camden and Rockland Water "Company, a corporation created by special 
act of the legislature and charged with the performance of a public duty" 
is hereby authorized to increase its capital stock to an amount not exceed­
ing .one million dollars. The stock authorized by this act may be issued 
either as common or preferred, from time to time and upon such terms and 
conditions as the corporation may determine; provided, however, that the 
issue of such capital stock shall be' subject to the provisions of section 
thirty-seven, chapter fifty-five of the revised statutes, and acts amendatory 
thereof; and it may hold real and personal estate for the purposes of the 
corporation to an amount not exceeding said sum.' 

Approved February 16, 1925 


