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SALE OF MILK. 191 

CHAP. 199 

tion under this section may be instituted in any county in which said 
woman may be arrested or in the county of Somerset, but in such case the 
costs and expense of trial shall be paid by the county from 'which said 
woman was originally committed, and payment enforced as provided in 
section sixty-eight of this chapter.' 

Approved April 10, 1925. 

Chapter 199. 

An Act Relating to the Department of the Attorney General. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of 1.11 aine, as follows: 

Additional assistant attorneys general, clerks or attorneys appointed by 
attorney general may be paid from moneys collected by department. 
Whenever the attorney general shall appoint any additional assistant at­
torneys general as authorized under existing law, or shall employ addi­
tional clerks as provided by statute, or shall employ attorneys at law to 
collect claims due the state, the compensation of such assistants, clerks or 
attorneys, as approved by the governor and council, may be paid, if the 
governor and council so direct, from moneys thus collected by the attorney 
general's department. 

Approved April 10. 1925. 

Chapter 200. 

An Act to Define Certain Grades of Milk Offered for Sale Within the State. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Sec. I. "Grade A Milk" defined; penalty for selling milk designated as 
"Grade A Milk", not conforming to standard; commissioner of agriculture 
to enforce provisions. The term "Grade A Milk" shall apply to natural 
milk which shall contain not less than four per cent butter fat, nor less 
than twelve and fifty hundredths total solids, and shall come from cows 
free from disease as determined by tuberculin tests by a qualified veter­
inarian, and that the bacterial count shall not exceed fifty thousand per 
cubic centimeter plate count as determined by the standard methods of the 
American Public Health Association, at time of delivery to consumer, and 
shall be produced in dairies that score at least eighty on the U. S. Bureau 
of Animal Industry score card. vVhoever by himself, his servant or agent, 
sells, exchanges or delivers or has in his custody or possession with intent 
to sell, exchange or ,deliver any milk, designated as "Grade A Milk" and 
not conforming to the' rules, r~<TUlations and standards, as established under 


