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TOWN OF PERKINS-WINTHROP LIBRARY. 531 

CHAP. 106 

Sec. 3. Term defined. The term automobile as used in this act shall 
include all vehicles self-propelled on the highway, town ways and public 
streets by motive power of whatsover kind namely, automobiles used for 
the conveyance of persons for hire only, but not including road-rollers so 
called. 

Approved March 26, 1917. 

Chapter 106. 
An Act to Repeal the Act Incorporating the Town of Perkins. 

Be it enacted by the Peo/)le of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Sec. 1. Corporate existence preserved for certain purposes. The act 
entitled, "An Act to Incorporate the Town of Perkins," approved June 
twenty-four, eighteen hundred and forty-seven, is hereby repealed; pro­
vided, however, that the corporate existence, powers, duties and liabilities 
of said town shall smvive for the purpose of prosecuting and defending aU 
pending suits and cases of suits to which said town is or may be a party, 
and all needful processes growing out of the same, and for the fmther pur­
pose of providing for the payment of all or any judgments, which may be 
recovered against such town. 

Sec. 2. Dispositon of unexpended school funds. All funds unexpended 
for school purposes at the time when this act is effective out of amounts 
raised by said town for school purposes or out of amounts paid by the 
state for school purposes, shall be paid by the treasurer of said town or 
such other person in whose custody such funds may be, to the treasurer 
of state. Such amounts, so received, shall constitute a fund for school 
purposes of which the income only shall be expended and applied for the 
schooling of children resident within the limits of the present town. 

Sec. 3. Date when effective. This act shall take effect and be in force 
from and after the first day of lVIarch in the year of our Lord one thousand 
nine hundred and eighteen. 

Approved March 26, 1917. 

Chapter 107. 
An Act to Ratify the Doings of the Town of Winthrop in Reference to the Charles 

M. Bailey Public Library. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

Sec. 1. Proceedings of town meeting of Nov. 4th, 1916, validated. The 
action of the voters of the town of ·Winthrop at the meeting thereof held 
upon the fourth day of November, nineteen hundred and sixteen in voting 
to authorize the selectmen thereof to enter into a contract with Charles lVI. 
Bailey respecting the support and management of the Charles lVI. Bailey 


