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TOWN OF PORTAGE LAKE. 

Section 3. Municipal and police COl11'ts and trial justices 
within their respective counties shall have, upon complaint, 
original and concurrent jurisdiction with the supreme and su­
perior courts, in all offenses arising under this act, and all fines, 
forfeitures and penalties received for any violation of this act 
shall be paid forthwith by the person receiving the same to the 
state treasurer, and credited to fines and license fees for tne 
protection of birds and game. 

Approved March 24, 1909. 

Chapter 281. 

An Act to incorporate the Town of Portage Lake. 

Be it enacted by the !eople of the State of }ylaine, as follows: 

Section 1. Township number thirteen in the sixth range of 
townships, west from the east line of the state of Maine, here­
tofore known as Portage Lake Plantation, is hereby incorpor­
ated as a town under the name of Portage Lake; and the in­
habitants thereof are hereby invested with all the powers and 
privileges and subject to the duties and liabilities incident to 
other towns in this state. 

Section 2. The collectors of the plantation of Portage Lake 
shall have power to finish the collection of all taxes which 
shall have been committed to them for collection prior to the 
passage of this act, and to settle with and pay the same to the 
treasurer of the town of Portage Lake; and the several officers 
of said plantation are empowered to perform all the duties of 
town officers in the town created by this act, until their suc­
cessors shall have been legally chosen and qualified as town 
officers of the town of Portage Lake under this act. 

Section 3. Any justice of the peace may call the first meet­
ing of the town of Portage Lake by posting a warrant therefor, 
-stating the obj ects of said meeting, in three public and con­
spicuous places in said town, at least seven days before the 
time of holding said meeting. 

Section. 4. All property now belonging to Portage Lake 
plantation shall belong to, and the title thereof is hereby vested 
in the town of Portage Lake. 

Section 5. The persons hereafter becoming chargeable as 
paupers within the limits of said town shall be chargeable to 
said town of Portage Lake, excepting those who are now state 
paupers. 

Approved March 24. 190~. 

617 
OHAP, 281 

Jurisdiction 
of courts. 

-fines, how 
disposed of. 

Town of 
Portage 
Lake incor­
porated. 

Collection 
of taxes, 
committed 
for collec­
tion prior to 
passage of 
this act. 

-duty of 
plantation 
officers. 

First meet­
ing, how 
called. 

Property 
vested in 
town Pau­
pers, how 
charge­
allle. 


