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PRIVATE AND SPECIAL LAWS 

OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE. 



LAKE NEQUASSE1'-UPPER 51'. JOHN RIVER IMP. CO. 

payment of the principal and interest of such bonds, debts and 
loans, part or all of its property and franchise. 

Section 9. \l'lhenever said company shall, at a meeting of its 
stockholders called for the purpose, vote to increase its capital 
stock to any sum not exceeding fifty thousand dollars, said com­
pany may issue its bonds for a like amount, and may mortgage 
or pledge all or any part of its property and franchise according 
to the provisions of section nine of chapter fifty-five of the 
revised statutes. 

Section 10. This act shall take effect when approved. 

Approved March 20, 1907. 

Chapter 313. 
An Act to amend Chapter fifteen of the Private and Special Laws of 

nineteen hnndred and five, relating to Lake Neqnasset. 

Be it ellacted by the Sellate and Honse of Represelltativestn 
Legislature assembled, as follows: 

Section 1. Section two of chapter fifteen of the private and 
special laws of nineteen hundred and five, is hereby amended 
by striking out the words; "of such kind and amount as either 
by itself or in connection with other matter will tend to corrupt 
or impair the purity of the water, or tend to render it injurious 
to health," so that said section, as amended, shall read as fol­
lows: 

'Section 2. No person shall hereafter throw the body of any 
dead animal, or other offensive material, into the waters of said 
lake or leave the same upon the lake when frozen; nor shall any 
sewage, drainage, refuse or polluting matter be discharged into 
said lake. Nothing herein shall be construed as taking away or 
limiting the right to harvest ice from said lake, or as prohibiting 
the cultivation and use of the soil in the ordinary methods of 
agriculture, if no excrement or foul or decaying matter is used 
within five hundred feet of the line of high water on the shores 
of said lake.' 

Section 2. This act shall take effect when approved. 

Approved :March 20, 1907. 
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