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CHAP. 170 

Fishing in 
B pond 
regulated. 

Penalty for 
violation of 
this ac't. 

Proviso. 

Fishing in 
Cherno 110ne[ 
and 'tribu­
taries, 
regulated. 

Penalty for 
violation of 
,this act. 

FISHING IN D POND-CHEi\IO POND. 

Chap tel.' 170. 
An Act to regulate fishing in D Pond, in Upton, in the County of Oxford. 

Be it ell acted by the Sellate alld House of Representatives in 
Legislature asseillbled, as follows: 

Section 1. It shall be unlawful to fish for, take, catch or 
kill any kind of fish at any time in B pond, so called, in Upton, 
in the connty of Oxford, except in the ordinary manner of cast­
ing with artificial flies or fly fishing'. 

Section 2. VVhoever violates any of the provisions of this act 
shall be subject to a penalty of not less than ten dollars nor more 
than thirty dollars and costs for each offense and a further pen­
alty of one dollar for each fish taken, caught, killed or had in 
possession in violation of the provisions of this act. 

Section 3. Provided, further, that this act shall not take effect 
until the commissioners of inland fisheries and game, without 
expense to the state, have caused notices to be posted in con­
spicuo11s places at or near the waters herein described setting 
forth in substance the provisions of this act. 

Approved March 6, 1907. 

Chapter 171. 
An Act ,to regulate fishing in the tributaries to Cherno Pond, in ,the County 

of Penobscot. 

Be it ell acted b}1 the Sell ate alld HOl/se of Represelltatives ill 
Legislature asseillbled, as follows: 

Section 1. It shall be unlawful to fish for, take, catch or kill 
any kind of fish at anytime in any of the tributaries to Chemo 
pond, in the cOllllty for a distance of one mile up the stream from 
the month of each tributary. Provided that, without expense to 
the state, the mile point on each stream shall be plainly marked 
with a proper llotice. 

Section 2. vVhoever violates any of the provisions of this act 
shall be subj ect to a penalty of not less than ten dollars nor more 
than thirty dollars for each offense and a further penalty of one 
dollar for each fish taken, caught, killed or had in possession in 
violation of the provisions of this act. 

Approved March 6, 1907. 


