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100 
CHAP. 224 

Fred 'V. Lee, 
andJ.D. 
Buck, in 
iavor of. 

Secretary 
of State's 
office, 
repair of. 

Unexpired 
petldlers' 
licenses, in 
favor of 
paying. 

LEE; j,ND nUCK-PROTE;CTING RE;CORDS-HAWKE;RS & PE;DDLE;RS. 

Chaptel' 224. 
Resolve in favor of the Clerk and Stenographer, and the Messenger to the 

Judiciary Committee. 

Resol'Ved, That there be appropriated and paid to Fred 'vV. Lee 
the sum of three hundred and fifty doUars for services as clerk 
and stenographer to the judiciary committee; and that there be 
appropriated and paid to John D. Buck the sum of fifty dollars 
for services as messeng'er to the same committee. 

Approved .March 21, 1901. 

Resolve in favor of protecting the Records in Secretary of state's Office. 

R('soh'ed, That the sum of seven thousand five hundred dol­
lars be and hereby is appropriated for the year nineteen hundred 
and one and seven thousand five hundred dollars for the year 
nineteen hundred and two, to be expended by the superintendent 
of public buildings and the secretary of state. under direction of 
the governor and council, in making such repairs as are needed 
to render fireproof the office of the secretary of state and the 
approaches thereto and protect the records therein; to furnish 
the same with steel shelving and filing cases and to index and file 
in a proper and systematical manner the papers contained in said 
office. 

Approved March 21, 1901. 

Chap tel' 226. 
Resolve in favor of paying the unexpired licenses of Hawkers and Peddlers. 

Resolved, That the treasurer of state be and hereby is author­
ized and directed to pay to each and every, person holding a state 
license as hawker and peddler. issued by the secretary of state 
prior to May twentieth, nineteen hundred, such an amount as 
the proportion of the unexpired time of such license subsequent 
to May twentieth, nineteen hundred, bears to the whole time for 
which such license was issued. And that the sum of eighteen 
hundred dollars be and hereby is appropriated out of any funds 
in the treasury, not otherwise appropriated. for the puroose of 
this resolve. Provided, however. that those receiving from the 
state any amount on account of unexpired licenses by virtue of 


