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LIVERMORE: FAI,LS UGH'f AND POWER COMPANY. 

An Act to amend the charter of the Liyermore Falls Light and Power Company. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and Honse of Representatives in 
Legislat'nre assembled, as follows: 

Section I. The rights, powers and privileges granJted by 
chapter iour hundred and seventy(hvo of the private and 'special 
laws of eighteen hundred and ninety-seven, entitled "An Act to 
incorporate the Livermore Falls Light and Power Company," as 
amende(t by chapter one hundred and one of the private and 
special laws of eighteen hundred and ninety-nine, are further 
amended 3JS follows: 

'Section 1. The same rights, po-wers and privileges granted 
by chapter t(1ur hundl-ed and seventy-two of the private and 
special laws of eighteen hundred and ninety-seven, entitled, "An 
Act to incorporate the Livermore Fall's Light and Power Com­
pany," as amended by chapter one hundred and one of the 
private and special Jaws of eighteen hundred and ninety-nine, 
are hereby granted to the said Livermore Falls Light and Power 
Company to extend to the towns of Fayette, Readfield, Win­
throp and Mount Vernon in the county of Kennebec, and Ches­
terville and 'Wilton in the county of Franklin. 

Section 2. The towns of Fayette, Readfield, Winthrop and 
Mount Vernon in the county of Kennebec, and Chesterville and 
Wilton in the county of Franklin are hereby authorized to con­
tract with said corporation for lighting the streets within said 
towns upon such terms as they may mutually agree. 

Approyed January 29, 1901. 


