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80 
CHAP. 143 

Distribution of 
Reports, in 
favor of. 

Uhitdl'cn's 
Horne,in 
favor of. 

IJa tten 
_Acadclllr, 
in favor of. 

REPORT.:l-CHILDREN'S HOME-PATTEN ACADElI11:. 

Rosolve in fayor of the distribution of vuriouB roporto, 

Resolved, That the secretary of state be authorized to fur­
nish annually to the clerk of each town, to be by them diR­
tributed, a number of copies, proportional to the farmers 
therein, the reports of the Maine boat'd of agricu ltu l'e, the 
bureau of industrial and labor statistics, and the Maine state 
college. The expense of sllch transportation to be paid out 
of funds appropriated for the use of these dcpartmen ts. 

Approved Febl'llary 14, 1869. 

R~solve in aid of the Childrcn's Honl<' in Bnngol'. 

Resolved, That the SUill of one thousand dollars be anel is 
hereby appropriated for the Children's Home of Bangor, for 
the year eighteen hundt'eel and eighty-nine, and the Sllme 
alllount for the year eighteen hundt'ed and ninety. 

Approved Februury 18, 1889. 

Resolye in favor of Patten Academy. 

Resolved, That the sum of five hundred elollal's is hereby 
appropriated, for the term of ten years, to Patten Academy, 
an institution of leal'ning in the town of Patten, in the county 
of Penobscot, provided, however, that this appropriation is 
made on the expt'ess condition that the trustees of said insti­
tution shall maintain and keep in operation, a school equal 
in rank and gt'ade of teachi.ng with a first-class academy; and 
provided further, that the governor 'and council and superin­
tendent of common schools, shall have a right at all times to 
visit said school when the same shall be in operation, and if 
in the opinion of the governor and conncil, said institution, 
at any time hereafter, shall fail to fulfill the conditions con­
tained in this resolve, they may, in their discretion, withhold 
the appropriation herein granted. 

Approved February 18, 1869, 


