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CHAP. 270. 

Ff~ight sheds, 
ca.r houses, &c. 

Rai.lroad commis­
sioners to have 
jurisdiction in 
rna tters of detail 
for C8l'l',Ying out 
objects of act. 

Amellded. 

• 

ACT ASSESSING STATE TAX AMENDED. 

stream and land of the Bangor Bridge Company and others, and 
south of said European and North American Railroad location, as 
may be necessary for the cars of said Bangor, Oldtown and Mil­
ford Railroad Company, and all needed frogs, switches, &c., and 
erect such freight sheds, cai' houses and othel' structures on the 
same as· may be necessary. 

SECT. 4. All matters of detail necessary for carrying out the 
objects of this act, not heretofore provided for, are herebyespe­
cially placed within the jUlisdiction of the railroad commissioners; 
pro·vided, that a hearing of the parties interested shall be had 
before the railroad commissioners, and if either party neglect to 
appear after due notice, the commissioners may proceed without 
them and the railroad commissioners shall determine what propor­
tion of the cost of the European and North American Railway 
between their terminus at the foot of Exchange street in Bangor, 
and the point of connection of the two roads, the said Bang'or, 
Oldtown and Milford Railroad Company ought equitably and justly 
in view of all of the circumstances of the case to pay the Euro­
pean and North American Railway Company, and said commis­
sioners shall certifY their decision in writing, and no third rail, 
side track, or other erections shall be made until said sum so 
certified by said commissioners is paid by the said Bangor, Old­
town, and Milford Railroad Company to the said European and 
North American Railway Company. 

Approved Maroh 12, 1869. 

Chapter 270. 
An act to amend" on aot ossessing a stato tax for eighteen hundred and sixty-nine." 

Be it enacted by the Senate ancl House of Rep?'esentatives in Legis­
lature assembled, as follows: 

SECT. 1. That so much of the act assessing a state tax for eigh­
teen hundred sixty-nine, on the plantations of Grant Isle, Mada­
waska, Dion, D' Aigle and Fort Kent, in the county of Aroostook, 
is repealed. The sum of three hundred eleven dollars seventy­
four cents is assessed as the state tax for eighteen hundred sixty­
nine on the town of Grant Isle j the sum of four hundred one 
dollars fifty-three cents on the town of Madawaska; the sum of four 
hundred one dollars fifty-two cents on the town of Dickeyville, and 
the sum of two hundred thirty-one dollars sixteen cents on the 
town of Fort Kent. 

SECT. 2. This act shall take effect when approved. 

Approved Mllroh 13, 186~. 




