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ACTS AND RESOLVES 

PASSED DY THE 

FORTY-SIXTH LEGISLATURE 

OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE. 

1867. 

Published by the Secretary of State, agreeably to Resolves of June 28, 1820, 
February 26, 1840, and March 16, 1842. 

AUGUSTA: 
STEVENS &; SAYWARD, PRINTERS TO THE STATE. 

1867. 



RESOLVES 

OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE. 

1867, 



TAX.-HOULTON AND BARING ROAD.-H. B. HERSEY. 

Resolve layiug a tax on the sevel'l1l couuties in this state. 

109 
CHAP. 143. 

Resolved, That the sums annexed to the counties in the follow- County taxes, 

ing schedule are hereby granted as a tax on each county respec- provisiou for. 

tively, to be appropriated, assessed, collected and applied for the 
purpose of paying the debts and necessary expenses of the same 
and other purposes ordered by law, to wit :-Androscoggin, nine~ 
teen thousand one hundred dollars; Aroostook, nine thousand one 
hundred and ten dollars; Cumberland, seventy-nine thousand one 
hundred and fifty dollars; Franklin, ten thousand dollars; Hancock, 
ten thousand three hundred and fifty dollars; Kennebec, twenty-
seven thousand five hundred dollars; Knox, twelve thousand one 
hundred and sixty-three dollars and thirty-four cents; Lincoln, 
eight thousand five hundred dollars; Oxford, nine thousand dol-
lars; Penobscot, thirty thousand dollars; Piscataquis, five thousand 
dollars; Sagadahoc, nine thousand dollars; Somerset, ten thousand 
dollars; Waldo, seventeen thousand dollars; Washington, fifteen 
thousand dollars; York, fifteen thousand dollars. 

Approved February 25, 1867. 

Resol ve authorizing repairs upon tho Houlton and Bariug road. 

Resolved, That the sum of six hundred dollars be, and the same 
is hereby appropriated to be expended under the direction of the 
land agent for repairing the Houlton and Baring road, as follows, 
viz :-One hundred dollars upon the road leading through town­
ship number eleven; range one at the Monument, and five hundred 

. dollars upon that part of the road leading through Indian town-
ship. 

Approved February 25, 1867. 

Resolvo authorizing a conveyanoe of land to H. B. Hersey. 

Resolved, That the land agent be authorized to convey to II. B. 
Hersey, the south half of section number fifty in township num­
bered four in the fifth range, west east line of state, in considera­
tion of the usual requirements of a settler, excepting a residence 
thereon .. 

Approved February 25, 1867. 

Houlton and 
Baring road, 
$600 in favor 
of. 

H. B. Hersey, 
in favor of. 


