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1862. 
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INTERNATIONAL BANK. 

SECI'. 2. The county commissioners for the said county of Saga­
dahoc, after notice eight days already given, or that may hereafter 
be given of the time and place of their meeting for such purpose, 
which said notice shall be published in two public newspapers 
printed in said county, and posted np in three public places in the 
town where said territory is situated, may and shall proceed forth­
with to estimate the compensation for the estate held for the pur­
pose herein provided to be paid by the United States to the owner 
or owners thereof. 

SECT. 3. In case any owner of said estate so held as aforesaid 
is unknown, or is a minor, idiot, lunatic or insane person not under 
guardianship, or is absent from the state, not having an agent or 
attorney within the state, the compensation awarded by said com­
missioners for the share of said estate belonging to such person, 
shall be paid to the treasurer of the state of .Maine, to be held by 
him and his successor in office, in trust for, and to be repaid to 
such owner when ascertained, to the lawful guardian of such in­
competent person, or to the lawful agent or attorney of such absent 
person, on demand. 

SECI'. 4. This act shall take effect from and after its approval 
by the governor. 

[Approved .January 9, 1862.] 

An act additional to "an act to increaso tho capibl stocle of the International Bank." 

Be it enactecl by the Senate and House oj Rep1'esentatives in Legis­
lature assembled, as follows: 

SEG'l'. 1. A further time of one year from the first day of April 
next, is hereby allowed for paying in the last half of the increased 
capital stock of the International Bank, authorized by an act passed 
on the first day of February, in the year eighteen hundred and 
sixty· one, with such privileges and under such limitations, in all 
other respects, as are provided by said act. 

SECT. 2. 'rhis act shall take effect from its approval by the gov­
ernor, 

[Approved Januflry 17, 18G2.] 


