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RESOL YES 

OF THE 

STATE OF MAINE. 

i860. 



C. D. GILMORE.-LITERARY INS'rITUTIONS.-CLTNTON GORE. 

Resolye in fltVOl' of Clutrles D. Gilmore. 

ResollJed, That there be paid out of the treasury from money not 
otherwise appropriated, to Oharles D. Gilmore, the sum of fifty 
dollars, being' the sum paid into the said treasury by the said Gil­
more through mistake, nnd under a misapprehellsion of the require­
ments of law. 

[Approved lVhreh 10, 1850.] 

Chaptcl' 366. 

Resolye relltting to certain acltdemies and other litcmry institutions. 

Whel'ects, certain academies and other literary institutions in thil:l 
I:ltate holding fnnds in trust for the support of schools, 1!a,ve failed 
to keep such schools in operation, therefore, 

371 
CHAP. 365. 

CJlHrles I), 
Hiluun'c, in 
favor of. 

ResollJecl, That the superintendent of common schools is hereby Academies, 

directed to obtain from said trustees a statement of the facts in the t~~" relatin?; 

case, including the amount of funds originally placed in their hands, 
the amount of interest accruing' therefrom, the uses which have 
been made of the same, and the manner in which such funds are 
now invested, and to present the result of his investig'ations in his 
next annual report. 

ResollJecl, That the sllperintendent of schools be directed to inrluire 
into the standing and condition of the various chartered literary in­
:;titutions ill the state, the amount of funds now held in trust by 
them, severally, their mode of investment, the annual income of the 
sa,me, and the uses made thereof; and to inquire, r;pecially, what 
facilities are furnished by said institutions for the education of pub-
lic school teachers, and what number of pupils in the past year have 
attended these institutions with special reference to becoming quali-
fied to instruct in the public schools; and to communicate the result 
of his inquirieR in his next annual report. 

[Approyed March 19, 1860.] 

Resolye in r>tyor of Clinton Gore plantation. 

Resolved, 'l'hat the secretary o£ state be directed to deliver to the 
clerk of Clinton Gore plantation, one copy of the revised statutes, 
one copy of Virgin's dig'est, and the other books usually furnished 
to towns, for the use of si'tirl plantation; pJ'ovided such books are 
011 hand 111 the library. 

[Approved iYInrch 19, 18(10.] 
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