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HARPSWELL ACADE~IY. 

per cent. yea,rly from the day when the ta,x beca,me payable, with 
fifty cents more for the wa,rrant. 

SECT. 5. Tha,t whenever any state tax, a,ssessed upon a,ny city, 
town or plantation, shall rema,in unpaid after the pa,y da,y a,ppointed 

therefor, such city, town or pla,nta,tion is hereby precluded from 
drawing from the state treasury the school fund, set a,part for such 
city, town or pla,nta,tion, so long as such delinquent ta,x sha,ll rema,in 
unpa,id. 

SECT. 6. This act sha,ll be in force from a,nd after its a,pproval 

by the governor. 
[Approved April 1, 1859.] 

An act to incorporatc thc Trustecs of Harpswell Acadcmy. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Represmtatives in 
Legislature assembled, as follows: 

SECT. 1. Clement Skolfield, J. S. Wyer, John Wilson, N. C. 
Alexa,nder, Simeon Curtis, Hiram A. Dunning, David S. Dunning, 
Benja,min P. Dunning, J olm F. Randall, Cha,rles Dunning, Charles 

J. Bishop, Clement S. Dunning, J olm Bishop, Rufus Dunning, 

Geo. R. Skolfield, Samuel S. J orda,n, Abizer Holbrook, second, 
Robert Pennell, Alcot S. Pennel, Thomas Pennel, Alexander Ew­
ing, Charles Johnson, Henry Ba,rnes, Lemont P. Ca,rr, George L. 
Williams, Joseph D. Wyer, Clement Skolfield, second, Albert Stover, 
George S. Dunning, Harmon Pennell and Charles A. Britt, their 
associa,tes and assigns are hereby constituted a corpomtion by the 
name of the Trustees of Ha,rpswell Academy, and by that name may 
sue a,nd be sued, make such by-laws as they may deem expedient for 
the management of their affairs in any way not repugnant to the 
la,ws of the state, a,nd fill all vacancies occurring in their number, 
ta,ke and hold any estate real or persona,l which they ma,y now pos­
sess, or ma,y hereafter receive by dO:la,tion or otherwise, the annual 
income of which shall not exceed the SUIll of two thousand dolla,rs, 
sa,id income to be faithfully applied to promote the cause of educa,­
tion, and the corpora,tion aforesaid are invested with all the powers 
a,nd privileges incident to similar corpomtions. 

SECT. 2. Any two of sa,id corporators are authorized to ca,ll the, 
first meeting of the corporation by posting up in two or more public 
places in said town of fJarpswell, notices thereof seven da,ys at least 
before .the time appointed for said meeting. 

[Approved April 2, 1859.J 


