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ACTS AND RESOLVES 

PASSED BY THE 

TWENTY-SECOND LEGISLATURE 

OF THE 

A. D. 1842. 

Publiohetl by the Secretary of State, agreeably to Resolves of June 28, 18~O, February 26,1840, and 
March 16, 184,2. 

AUGUSTA: 
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1842. 



RESOLVES 

OF THE 

STATE OF lllAINE, 

Extra Session, 184!3. 



N. E. BOUNDARY.-MF.MllEItS OF CONGRESS. 

delay, by the general government to this state, of the expenditl1l'es 
made under resolves passed January ~4, 1839, "relating to 
trespassers upon the public lands," and February 20, 1839, entitled 
a "resolve for the protection of the public lands;" and for all the 
expenditures, both military and civil, made by this state in protect­
ing its territory against threatened foreign invasion, and the trespas­
sers upon our public lands, instigated by an unfounded claim by a 
foreign power to a portion of om territory; and all other expendi­
tures incurred in carrying on the controversy in relation to the por­
tion of oUl' territory brought into dispute by Great Britain. 

113 
CHAP. 116. 

Resolved, That the governor be requested to furnish the said 
commissioners with the proper vouchers for establishing the claims 
of this state for the expenditures incurred as above stated. 

[Approved JJfay 27,1842.] 

Resol ve providing for the payment of certain commissioners. 

Resolved, That the governor and council be, and they hereby 
are, authorized to make suitable allowance, out of the contingent 
fund of the governor and council, to the commissioners chosen 
under the resolves passed at this session of the legislature, entitled 
"resolves in relation to the north eastern boundary of this state," 
the said allowance to be in full for their personal services; time and 
expenses in discharging the duties of their said commission. 

[Approved JJfay 27, 1842.] . 

Resolve in relation to the pay of members of congress. 

Resolved, That our senators in congress be instructed, and our 
representatives be requested to use their influence to procure the 
passage of a law reducing the pay of members of congress from 
eight dollars per day to six: dollars per day, and the mileage fi'om 
eight dollars to six dollars for every twenty miles travel. 

Governor to fur· 
nish commis­
sioners with 
vouchers. 

Compensation to 
commissioners. 

Resolved, That the secretary of state be requested to forward to 
each of our senators and representatives in congress a copy of this 
resolution. 

[Approved jJ'ray 28, 1842.] 


