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SLATE QUARRYING COMP.-lVIINING COMPo 

Chal)tel' 3~3. 

AN ACT to incorporate the Burnard Slate Qual'l'ying Company. 

Approved March 21,1837. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives, 

4,25 

in Legislattt1'e assembled, That Augustus W. Walker, Corporator •. 

Rufus Dwinal, Albert Tibbetts, Luther Dwinal, their asso-
ciates, successors and assigns, be, and they hereby are 
created a corporation, by the name of the Barnard Slate Corporate name. 

Quarrying Company, for the plll'pose of quarrying, man-
ufacturing amI working slate on their own land, in the 
town of Barnard, in the County of Penobscot, and of 
transporting, vending and dealing in the same; with power C'pita! Stock,­

to hold and manage real estate not exceeding one hundred $200,000. 

thousand dollars; and personal estate not exceeding the 
same amount; and have all the powers and privileges, and 
subject to all the duties and requirements incident by law 
to similar corporations. 

AN AC'l' to ohange the name of the Portland, Scurborough, nnd Phipsburg 
lVIiniug Company. 

Approved March :iI, 1837. 

SECTION 1. Be it enacted by the Senate and House of 
Representatives, in Legislattwe assembled, That the name 
of the" Portland, Scarborough and Phipsburg Mining 
Company" incorporated February twenty-first one thou­
sand eight hundred and thirty-folll'; be changed, to the 
Maine Mining Company; and that they hereafter be known Name 

as such. 



426 

. Port of former 
Act repealed. 

Rat •• of toll. 

LISBON BRIDGE. 

Sl!;CT. 2. Be 1:t further enacted, That all Acts and 
parts of Acts inconsistent with this Act, be and they arB 
hereby repealed. 

ChapteR' 3.2ii. 

AN ACT to in~re8.e the toll of Lisbon Bridge. 

Approved March 21, 1837. 

Be i~ enacted by the Senate and House qf Representa­
tives, in Legislature assembled; That instead of the toll 
established by " An Act entitled an Act for incorporating 
certain persons for building a Bridge over Androscoggin 
River, between Lisbon and Durham and for supporting 
the same," the following rates of toll be and hereby are 
established, viz. for each foot passenger two cents; for 
each person and horse, six and one quarter cents; for each 
wagon 01' cart, drawn by one horse, ten cents; and for 
each additional horse, two cents; for each chaise, chair, 
or sulkey, drawn by one horse, twelve and a half cents; 
each coach, chariot, phreton 01' cUl'ricle, drawn by two 
horses, twenty-five cents, and every additional horse foul' 
cents each; for each cart, wagon, 01' other like carriage of 
burthen, drawn by two beasts, twelve and one half cents, 
and every additional beast, two cents; for each sleigh or 
sled, drawn by one beast, six and a quarter cents, every 
additional beast two cents each; each wheelbarrow, hand­
cart, or other vehicle capable of carrying a like weight, 
with one person, three cents; for neat cattle or horses, 
other than t,hose rode on, or in carriages or teams, two 
cents each; for sheep and swine, at the rate of six cents 
the dozen; and to each team one person shall be' allowed 
as drivel', and no more, for the toll as established for 
teams. Provided however, that the Legislature shall at all 


