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RESOLVES 

OF THE 

TWELFTH LEGISLATURE 

OF THE 

S'I'ATE OF MAINE, 

PASSED A'r THE SESSION 

WIIICH COMiUENCED ON THE FOURTH DAY OF JANUARY} AND ENDED ON 

THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, ONE THOUSAND EIGHT 

HUNDRED AND THIRT1"~T"WO. 

PUBLISHED AGREEABLY TO THE RESOLVE OF JUNE 28, 1820. 

AUGUSTA: 

1. BERRY & CO., PRINTERS TO THE STATE. 

1832. 



424 s. SEAVEY AND T. TRUNDY.~A. B. THOMPSON. 

Provided, that the said conveyance by the Land Agent, 
shall be made whenever said Adams and Davisshall furnish 
and deliver to said Treasurer before the first day of Sep­
tember next, their notes with good and 'sufficient sureties 
to the acceptance of said TreaSUl'er for the said sums, and 
payable at the times specified as aforesaid. 

Cbapter 97. 

Resolve in fa VOl' of Samuel Seavey and Thomas 'l'rundy. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, That for reasons set forth in the petition of 
Samuel Seavey and Thomas Trundy, both of Wiscasset in 
the County of Lincoln, there be paid out of the State 
Treasury, to said Seavey the sum of one hundred and ninety 
two dollars and fifty cents, and to the said Trundy the sum 
of forty-six dollars. The aforesaid slims being severally 
allowed them, for supporting one John Wheeler, an insane 
person in Wiscasset Gaol, while they were Keepers of the 
same. Said sums to be in full of all claims either of them 
have on the State for said Wheeler's support up to Febru­
ary sixth, eighteen hundred and thirty-two. And the 
Governor with consent of Council, is hereby authorized to 
draw his warrant on the TreasUl'Y, in favor of the said Sea-· 
vey and Trundy for the aforesaid several sums. 

Cbal)ter 98. 

Resolve in favor of Abner B. Thompson. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, That - there be allowed and paid out of the 
'freaSlll'Y, to Abner B. Thompson, late Treasurer of State, 
the sum of three dollars and eighty three cents in full for 
articles furnished by him for the use of the State, which 
were omitted to be entered on his last account. 


