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RESOLVES 

OF THE 

TWELFTH LEGISLATURE 

OF THE 

S'I'ATE OF MAINE, 

PASSED A'r THE SESSION 

WIIICH COMiUENCED ON THE FOURTH DAY OF JANUARY} AND ENDED ON 

THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, ONE THOUSAND EIGHT 

HUNDRED AND THIRT1"~T"WO. 

PUBLISHED AGREEABLY TO THE RESOLVE OF JUNE 28, 1820. 

AUGUSTA: 

1. BERRY & CO., PRINTERS TO THE STATE. 

1832. 



DAILEYVII.LE, &C.-DISTRInUTION OF THE I.AWS 

with advice of the Council, is requested to draw his war­
rant for said sums in favor of the Adjutant General, when­
ever the public service may require the same; and for the 
expenditure thereof the Adjutant General shall be accoun-
table. . 

Cltaptel' 93, 

Resolve for the relief of the Inhabitants of Baileyville and Plnntation num­
ber seventeen in the County of Wllshington. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, That there be paid out of the Treasury of this 
State to the inhabitants of the town of Baileyville and Plan­
tation number seventeen, the sum of one thousand dollars 
each, to be paid to the Treasurers of said town and planta­
tion, to be applied by said Treasurers towards the payment 
of any taxes or assessments, which may be assessed on said 
Baileyville or Plantation number seventeen by reason of 
warrants of distress, which are noW issued against the in­
habitants of said Baileyville and plantation number seven­
teen by the County Commissioners [or the County o[ 
'Yashington, for repairing and completing the Baring and 
Houlton road, through said town and plantation. Provided 
said ,sums shall be applied to the extinguishment of the 
taxes or assessments upon the actual settlers, and not be 
applied to or for any other purpose. 

Resolved, That the Governor with advice of Council is 
authorized to draw his warrants on the Treasury for the 
aforesaid sums in favor of the Treasurers of the town of 
Baileyville and plantation number seventeen. 

Cltalltelo Uti. 

Resolvo for the further distribution of the Laws of the State. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, That the Secretary of State be and he hereby 
is authorized and directed, in addition to the requirement 
of the Resolve passed the twentieth day of January one 
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J.l.ME~ PRIBIII,E.-TOWNIHIP No.5. 2D RANGE. 423 

thousand eight hundred and twenty three, to furnish to the 
Executive Departments of each of the States of the United 
States, two printed copies of the Laws passed annually by 
the Legislature of this State. 

Chap tel' 9:). 

Resolve in favor of James Pribble. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, ,That there be allowed and paid out of the 
Treasury of this State to James Pribble the sum of five 
dollars and ninety five cents, for labor in stone-cutting on 
the Public Buildings at Augusta in the year one thousand 
eight hundred and thirty. ' 

Chaptel' 96. 

Resolve relating to land in Township No.5, 2t1 Range North of tho Million 
, Acres, East of Penobscot River. 

Approved March 9, 1832. 

Resolved, That the Land Agent be, and hereby is author­
ized and directed to release by deed of quitclaim, to Eli­
ashib Adll.ms and Asa Davis of Bangor, the right, title 
and interest of the State, in and to the surplus quantity of 
land within the half township of land originally granted to 
Foxcroft Academy, and within the lines and boundaries as 
surveyed and now held by them, the said Adams and Davis, 
amounting by estimation to two thousand two hundred and 
two aC,res, agreeably to the award and determination of 
Allen Gilman and Thomas A. Hill, to whom with James 
Crosby, the question was referred.-P1'Ovided, that the said 
Adams and Davis, perform on their part, the award of the 
said Referees, viz. pay to the State Treasurer, for the use 
of the State, the sum of one thousand one hundred and one 
dollars, in the following manner-one fourth of said sum 
with interest annually, in each of the four succeeding years 
from the date of -said award, which was the twentieth of 
September one thousand eight hundred and thirty one. 
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