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SEVENTY ~FIFTH LEGISLATURE 

HOUSE NO. 661 

House of Representatives, 1\,f arch 17, 19II 

Offered by Nlr. Strickland of Bangor. By 1vlr. Davies of Yar­

mouth tabled for printing pending acceptance. 

, C. C. HARVEY, Clerk. 

STATE OF MAINE 

HOUSE AMENDMENT "A" TO SENATE DOCUMENT 

NO. 170. 

Page 8. 
Amend Senate document No. 170, Bill, '·An Act to incor­

porate moneys for the expenditures of government for the year 
one thousand nine hundred and eleven", by striking out the 
words, "eighty-seven ·thous;md five hundred" and the figures 
"87,500.00", in the paragraph For soldiers' pensions, and insert­
ing in their place the words ''seventy-five thousand', and the fig-

• ures '75,000.00', so that said paragraph shall reacl: 
'For soldiers' pensions, as provided by chapter one hundred 

for.ty-five, sections one and two, Revised Statut~s, seventy-five 
thousand dollars .............................. . $75,000.00: 

HOUSE AMENDMENT "!{"' TO SE:\':\'l'E DOCUME~T 

NO. 170. 

Page 10. 

Amend Senate tlocurnent No. 170, Hill, "An c\ct to appro­
priate moneys for the expendit,:res of govcrn111u1t for the year 
one thousand nine hundred and eleven", by striking out the 
words, "sixty-three thousand nine hundred forty-five dollars and 
forty-four cents", anfl the figures "63,945.44", in the paragraph 



2 HOUSE-No. 66r. 

For Maine forestry ,district, and inserting m their place the 
words 'sixty-seven thousand nine hundred twenty-two dollars 
and forty-six cents', and the figures, '67,922.46', so that said 
paragraph shall read: 

'For Maine forestry district, as provided by chapter one 
hundred ninety-three, Public Laws of nineteen hundred ancl 
nine, sixty-seven thousand nine hundred twenty-two dollars and 
forty-six cents. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . %7,922.46.' 

HOUSE AMENDMEI\T "C'' TO SENATE DOCL:MENT 

NO. 170. 

Page 16. 
Amend Senate document Ko. 170, Bill, "An Act to appro­

priate moneys for the expenditures of government for the year 
one thousand nine hundred and eleven", by striking out the 
words, "For the purchase of intoxicating liquors, as proYicled 
by chapter two hundred fifty-two, section one, Public Laws of 
nineteen hundred and nine, fifty thousand dollars," and the 
figures, "50,000." 

HOUSE A:\fENDJVIENT "D'' TO SENA1'E DOCL'.l\JENT 

NO. 170. 

Page 16. 

Amend Senate document No. 170, Bill, "An Act to appro­
priate moneys for the expenditures of government for the year 
011e thousand nine hundred and eleven". by striking out the 
words, "thirty-seven thousand five hundred", and the figures 
"37,500.00", in the paraagraph, State of !lfoi11c Cattle Commis­
sion, and inserting in their place the words 'twenty-five thons­
ancl', and the figur~s '25.000.00'. so that said parag-raph shall 
read: 

'For prevention of contagious diseases among horses atH~ 
cattle. as proviclecl by chapter nineteen, section ten, Revised 
Statutes, as amenclecl by cbapt?r one lmhclred thirty--three, Pub­
lic Laws of nineteen lnmrlrerl and 11ine, twenty-five thousand 
dollars. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ................. $25 .oo::>.oo.' 
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HOUSE AMEND.\IE~T "E" TO SENATE DOCUMENT 

NO. r70. 

Page 23. 
Amend Senate document No. 170, Bill, ··An Act to appro­

priate moneys for the expenditures of go\'ernment for the year 
one thousand nine hundred and eleven", by striking out the 
words, "eighty-four thousand five hundred sixty-se\'en dollars 
and eight cents", and the figures, "84,567.08", in the last two 
lines of section one, and inserting in their place the words, 'thir­
teen thousand five hundred forty-four dollars and ten cents' and 
the figures, '13,544.10', so that said paragraph shall read: 

'Amounting to the sum of one million six hundred thirteen 
thousand five hunrlred forty-four dollars and ten cents. $r.6r3.-
544.10.' 




