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SENATE 

January 9, 1945 
The Senate was called to order by 

the President. 
Prayer by the Reverend Gordon 

Washburn of Hallowell. 
Journal of Thursday, January 4th, 

1945, read and approved. 

Communications 
MAINE DEVELOPMENT 

COMMISSION 
Everett F. Greaton, 
Executive Secretary 

State House, Augusta, Maine. 
January 5, 1945 

To the Honorable Senate and 
House of Representatives 
of the 92nd Legislature: 

The Maine Development Commis­
sion transmits, herewith, its final 
report on Post War Planning. 

The Maine Development Com­
mission was directed by the 91st 
Legislature to "cooperate with the 
various departments of the state, 
the Federal g'overnment or any of 
its agencies, the municipalities of 
this state, or private agencies with­
in this state in developing and co­
ordinating long-range plans for 
post war activities, and shall report 
to the next special or regular ses­
sion of the legislature on its activi­
ties under this section." 

The report covers these activities. 
Very truly yours, . 
EVERETT G. GRElATON, 

(S. P. 27) 
Executive Secretary. 

On motion by Miss Clough of 
Penobscot communication and ac­
companying report were tabled 
pending reference to a Committee. 

Mr. NOYES of Hancock: Mr. 
President I ask unanimous consent 
to address the Senate. 

Unanimous consent being granted, 
Senator Noyes addressed the Sen­
ate as follows: 

Mr. NOYES: Mr. President and 
members of the Senate, I note the 
presence in this Chamber today of 
a young man who has won renown 
and fame throughout the United 
States by his alertness which is a 
typical characteristic of all Ameri­
can boys. This young man is a 
young man by the name of Harvard 
Hodgkins from Hancock POint, 

Maine, which I am proud to repre­
sent here in this Body and it is my 
special privilege to present him 
here to you people today. Thank 
you. 

The PRESIDENT: The Chair will 
request the Senator from Hancock, 
Senator Noyes to conduct the gen­
tleman to a place at the rostrum. 

(Applause, the members rising') 
The PRESIDENT: In behalf of 

the Maine Senate it is my privilege 
and I am proud to be able to wel­
come you in the Senate and invite 
you to occupy a seat at my left as 
long as you care to stay. 

Orders 
On motion by Mr. Good of Aroos­

took, it was 
ORDERED, that 3,OQ.O additional 

copies of the "Governor's Message" 
be printed. 

On motion by Mr. Spear of Cum­
berland, it was 

ORDERElD, the House concurring, 
that Room 1 in the State Museum, 
be assigned for the use of the Com­
mittee on Inland Fisheries and 
Game, for this session of the Legis­
lature. (S. P. 28) 

Sent down for concurrence. 

On motion by Mr. Dunbar of 
Washington, it was 

ORDERElD, that the use of the 
Senate Chamber be granted to the 
Maine State Bar Association on the 
afternoon of Wednesday, January 
9th, 1945. 

On motion by Mr. Dorr O!f Oxford, 
it was 

ORDERED, that the Committee 
on Claims be granted the use of the 
Senate Chamber for public hearings 
each Tuesday during the session 
starting Tuesday, January 16th. 

On motion by the same Senator, 
it was 

ORDERED, that the use of the 
Senate Chamber be granted to the 
Committee on Ways and Bridges for 
public hearings on Wednesday and 
Thursday afternoons of each week 
during the session, beginning Wed­
nesday, January 17th. 

On motion by Mr. Leavitt of 
Cumberland 

Adjourned until tomorrow morn­
ing at ten o'clock. 




