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CHAP. 587 PUBLIC LAWS, 1971 

Application for such a permit shall be made in writing to the Commissioner 
of Agriculture at least 10 days prior to the date on which such event is 
contemplated, and shall give the name of the person, firm, corporation or 
unincorporated society or association holding such event and the date and 
place the event is to be held, provided that one application and one permit 
may include one or more separate events when so specified. Permits granted 
under this section shall not be transferable. 

Any person, firm, corporation or unincorporated association or society 
which conducts or causes to be conducted any public or private pulling event 
between animals or pairs of animals within the State, without a permit from 
the Commissioner of Agriculture, shall be punished in accordance with Title 
15, section 1741. 

Emergency clause. In view of the emergency cited in the preamble, this 
Act shall take effect when approved. 

Effective February 18, 1972 

CHAPTER 586 

AN ACT to Promote Vocational Education. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., T. 26, § 1043, sub-§ II, ~ F, sub-~ (6-1), additional. Paragraph F of 
subsection II of section 1043 of Title 26 of the Revised Statutes, as amended, 
is further amended by adding a new subparagraph (6-1) to read as follows: 

(6-1) Services performed by a student attending an elementary or secon­
dary school while participating in a cooperative program of education and 
occupational training. 

Effective June 9, 1972 

CHAPTER 587 

AN ACT to Clarify the Laws on Veterans Reemployment Rights in Public 
Service. 

Emergency preamble. Whereas, Acts of the Legislature do not become 
effective until 90 days after adjournment unless enacted as emergencies; and 

Whereas, Maine veterans are being deprived of reemployment in some 
public service jobs after returning from service in the Armed Forces of the 
United States; and 

Whereas, Maine statutes cover certain veterans seeking reemployment by 
governmental units other than federal, and such statutes do not presently 
afford adequate protection in many instances or are ambiguous; and 


