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CHAP. 10 

STUDY RELATING TO LOGS AND LUMBER 

Chapter 8 

RESOLV f'.s, 19G9 

RESOL VE, Authorizing Attorney General to Convey-Interest of the State 
in Certain Lands in Cumberland County. 

Resolves, 1957, c. 46, amended. Resolved: That chapter 46 of the resolves 
of 1957 is amended to read as follows: 

Authorizing the Attorney General to convey certain lands. Resolved: 
That the Attorney General be, and hereby is, authorized to convey by quit­
claim deed the interest of the State in the lands included in the area on the 
shore of Little Sebago Lake in the County of Cumberland, which lands lie in 
whole or in part between the ancient low water mark as established by the 
common law and the present low water mark of said lake, to such persons as 
shall have e1't #t@ effective 4tt+e ~ ~ resolve deeds and conveyances of rec­
ord purporting to convey to them title to such lands. 

Effective October L 1969 

Chapter 9 

RESOLVE, Regulating Ice Fishing on Indian, Orange, Rocky and Sunken 
Lakes in Washington County. 

Ice fishing on Indian, Orange, Rocky and Sunken Lakes; regulated. Re­
solved: That the Commissioner of Inland Fisheries and Game is authorized 
and directed to issue a rule and regulation to open Indian Lake, vVhiting 
Township; Orange Lake, Whiting Township; Rocky Lake, Marion, Edmunds 
and vVhitihg Townships; and Sunken Lake, vVhiting and Marion Townships, 
in the County of Washington, to ice fishing during February and March of 
each year. 

EtIective October L 1969 

Chapter 10 

RESOL VE, Authorizing the Forest Commissioner to Study the Laws, Rules 
and Regulations Relating to Logs and Lumber. 

Study of laws, rules and regulations relating to logs and lumber; author­
ized. Resolved: That the State Forest Commissioner is authorized and 
directed to make a study for purposes of revision of those laws, rules and 
regulations contained in the Revised Statntes, Title 30, chapter 225, pertain­
ing to logs and lumber. 

Effective October 1, 1969 


