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REGISTRATION OF VOTERS 

PUBLIC, 1945 

37 

CHAP. 13 

or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or by both such fine and 
imprisonment, except that in any county where a county farm for the 
reformation of inebriates has been established, any male person who has 
been previously convicted of intoxication may "be sentenced to such farm 
for a period of not less than 90 days, nor .more than II months.' 

Effective July 21, 1945 

Chapter 12 

. AN ACT Reliting to the Educational Requirements for Chiropractic 
Qualifications. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 65, § 4, amended. The 4th sentence of section 4 of chapter 65 of 
the revised statutes is hereby arriended to read as follows: 

'The applicant shall also present a diploma granted by a legally chartered 
chiropractic college, school, or university in good standing and having the 
power to confer degrees in chiropractic, which diploma shall show that it 
was granted on personal attendance of the applicant and completion of a 
course of 4 school years of not less than e 8 months each, and of a total of 
::!,See ee ffiifil:lte 3,600 school hours.' . 

Effective July 21, 1945 

Chapter 13 

AN ACT R.,elating to the Registration of Voters. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 3, § 39, amended. Section 39 of chapter 3 of the revised stat­
utes is hereby amended to read as follows: 

'Sec. 39. N ames not to be added or stricken out except as provided 
herein; names may be added at regular sessions on evidence. After the list 
provided for in section 38 is so prepared and deposited with the clerk and 
copy thereof posted, the selectmen shall not add thereto, nor strike there­
from, the name of any person, except in open session on one of the days 



38 DEFINITION OF CHIROPRACTIC SERVICE 

CHAP. 15 PUBLIC, 1945 

prescribed by law for receiving evidence of the qualifications of voters; 
nor shall they strike from such list the name of any person residing in 
the town, without notice first given to him that his right to vote is ques­
tioned, with opportunity for a hearing on one of such days. At any regular 
session ~ reeeiYing: ~ .evidenee provided for by sections 37, 4I, 42 and 
46, the selectmen shall place on the list of voters the name of every person 
known by, or proved to t1~em to be so qualified, whether he applies therefor 
or not.' 

Effective July 21, 1945 

Chapter 14 

AN ACT Relating to Terminology on Certification for the Practice of 
Chiropractic. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 65, § 6, amended. The 1st sentence of section 6 of chapter 65 of 
the revised statutes is hereby amended to read as follows: 

'When the board shall have granted to a person the certificate mentioned in 
section 5, such certificate shall designate the holder as a doctor of chiro7 
practic or chiropractor and shall be publicly displayed at the person's prin­
cipal place of business so long as such person shall continue to practice 
chiropractic for gain or hire.' 

Effective July 21, 1945 

Chapter 15 

AN ACT Relating to the Definition of Chiropractic Service. 

Be it enacted by the People of the State of Maine, as follows: 

R. S., c. 65, § 12, amended. Section 12 of chapter 65 of the revised stat­
utes is hereby amended to read as follows: 

'Sec. I2. Definition of chiropractic; other methods excluded. The sys­
tem, method, or science commonly kno~vn as chiropractic~ or the practice 
of chiropractic, is defined to be the science of palpating and adjusting the 
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