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34 DREW PLANTATION-WASHINGTON ACADEMY'. 

CHAP. 77 

Drew 
plantation, in 
(avor of. 

Washington 
Academy, in 
favor of. 

Resolve in favor of Drew Plantation. 

Resolved, That the sum of fifteen hundred dollars be and is 
hereby appropriated to aid in building a jJl'idge across the 
Mattawamkeag river at Drew Plantation, Penobscot county, 
provided a like amount be raised by said plantation and the 
county of Aroostook for the same purpose, the same to be 
drawn and expended by the county commissioners of Penob. 
scot and Aroostook counties. 

Approved March 23, 1891. 

Resolve in favor of Wushington Academy. 

Resolved, That the sum of five hundred dollars be hereby 
appropriated anullally for the term of ten years to 'Washing­
ton Academy, an institution of learning located in the town 
of' East Machias in the county of vVushington, provided, 
however, that this appropriation is made upon the express 
condition that the trustees of said ·institution shall maintain 
and keep in operation a school equal in rank and grade of 
teaching with a first class academy, of not less than three 
terms of ten weeks each during each year, and provided 
further, that the governor and council and l'uperintendent of 
common schools shall have a right at all Limes to visit said 
school when the same shall be in operation, and if in the 
opinion of the governor and council said institution shall at 
any time hereafter fail to fulfill the condition of this resolve 
they may in their discretion, withhold the appropriation 
herein granted. 

Approved March 23, 1891. 


